Craig Coffey

From: Jim Landon [JLandon@palmcoastgov.com]

Sent: Wednesday, November 13, 2013 12:10 AM

To: Phyllis F. Downes

Cc: City Council, Executive Team; Craig Coffey; Jim Manfre; Rick Staly, Kendra lannotti: Brian
Rothwell; Dianne Torino

Subject: Fwd: Final invoice
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Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Ms. Downes,

The City of Palm Coast has joined Flagler County and the Flagler County Sheriff’s Office in
cooperative discussions about our emergency communications. The committee looking into this
issue has been asked to address future communications system requirements and improvements.
It has been brought to our attention that the improvement plans developed a number of years
ago that was the foundation for the 2009 interlocal agreement are now out of date and new
plans must be developed. Through the communications committee we have informed the County
that we do not intend to continue to contribute additional resources to this effort until a
new plan has been developed and approved by all parties. We, therefore, do not intend to
submit the last two payments as outlined in our 2009 interlocal agreement until after a new
plan has been approved and it is confirmed that the total cost of the improvements will be at
least $3,000,000. After the new improvement plan is approved, the City will fulfill its
obligations under the 2009 agreement.

I would also like to take this opportunity to highlight another provision in our 2099
agreement. All expenditures under the subject agreement are to be a 50/50 match between Palm
Coast and Flagler County. The current City dollars being held in escrow by the County should
not be used until a new plan has been approved by all parties and any expenditures in which
City funds are used must be matched by County funds at that time.

I hope this is helpful. Please let me know if you have any questions.

Jim Landon

City Manager

City of Palm Coast

160 Cypress Point Pkway, Suite B-106

Palm Coast, FL 32164

Tel: 386-986-3702

www . palmcoastgov.com<http: //www.palmcoastgov. com>

Begin forwarded message:

From: Kendra Iannotti <kiannotti@palmcoastgov.com<mailto:kiannotti@palmcoastgov.coms>>

Date: November 1, 2013 at 8:51:59 AM EDT

To: Jim Landon <JLandon@palmcoastgov.com<mailto:JLandon@palmcoastgov.com>>, Steven Viscardi
<SViscardi@palmcoastgov.com<mailto:SViscardifdpalmcoastgov.com>>

Subject: FW: Final invoice

FYI, please see below request for payment.



*Thank you,

Kendra Iannotti

Executive Assistant to the City Manager
City of Palm Coast

160 Cypress Point Pkwy, Ste B-1@6
Palm Coast, FL 32164

Tel: 386-986-3719
Fax: 386-986-3703

www . palmcoastgov.com<http://www.palmcoastgov.com/>

<http://discoverpalmcoast.com/>
PLEASE NOTE: Florida has a very broad public records law. Most written communications to or
from City of Palm Coast officials and employees regarding public business are public records

available to the public and media upon request. Your e-mail communications may be subject to
public disclosure.




